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We had a lovely holiday mixer at
Birchwood Farms! Thanks to
everyone who made donations to
BraveHeart Estates! We made tons
of new friendships and are looking
forward to 2025 and more great
memories! 

January Gathering

December Reflections

January Gathering 1.8.25

February Gathering 2.12.25

March Gathering 3.12.25

April Gathering 4.9.25

Wednesday, January 8th at
11:30am at Northern Lights
Recreation Center (8865 M-119,
Harbor Springs).

Where and When 

“How to Read Food Labels &
Healthy Food Swaps” presented
by Kim Larson. 

Program Details

The lunch will be either Maurice
Salad with Breadstick OR Half
Veggie Wrap and Chips served
with Soda, Coffee or Tea and a
Mini Cobbler & Ice Cream for
dessert. 

Menu Options

Links and Contacts

Upcoming Events

December 2024

RSVP by 1.3.25
Click this link to reserve your
spot: January Registration Link

Or, email your menu choice to
tonya@cim-cnc.com along with
how you plan to pay

Or mail a check to Central
Industrial Manufacturing c/o
Tonya Fegan, 8422 N Moeller
Dr, Harbor Springs, MI 49740 

January Gathering

https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSfUWl3raCrLFoxtqfirPxG3cWSYplxRa6Y_S5osfzTO6Y7Qlw/viewform?usp=sharing
mailto:tonya@cim-cnc.com

